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MINUTES

FOX CHAPEL BOROUGH COUNCIL MEETING HELD APRIL 15, 2019
PRESENT:
Walter A. Scott, III, Mayor; Andrew C. Bennett, President; Harrison S. Lauer, Frederick C. Leech, Jay S. Troutman, Councilmembers; A. Bruce Bowden, Solicitor; Joy A. Hardt, Treasurer; Dana A. Abate, Borough Secretary.
ABSENT:
Thomas A. Karet, Ann R. Meyer, James M. Royston, Councilmembers; Gary J. Koehler, Borough Manager.

Mr. Bennett called the meeting to order at 6:07 P.M.

PUBLIC HEARING


Mr. Bennett called the Public Hearing to order at 6:07 PM and asked for comments/ questions from the audience regarding Conditional Use Application 19-01.  There being none, the Public Hearing was closed at 6:07 PM.


Mr. Bennett called the Public Hearing to order at 6:07 PM and asked for comments/ questions from the audience regarding Ordinance No. 709 amending the Conditional Use section of the Zoning Ordinance to include small wireless facilities (SWF).  There being none, the Public Hearing was closed at 6:08 PM.

MINUTES


It was moved by Mr. Leech that the minutes of the March 27, 2019 meeting be approved as submitted.  The motion was duly seconded and passed with Mr. Troutman abstaining since he was not in attendance.
BID AWARDS

SHACOG
Bids were received by SHACOG for spring and summer commodities.  Council was informed that in most cases, it is recommended that the contracts be awarded to the low bidder.  The primary exceptions are where the low bidder is unable to manufacture to our specifications, material quality, availability or where the added travel time to the low bidder's site would more than offset any cost savings.  The tabulation is as follows:

	MATERIAL
	VENDOR
	PRICE

	Road Material
	
	

	Crushed Gravel No. 8 (1B)
	No Bid
	

	Crushed Gravel No. 57 (2B)

Crushed Gravel No. 3 (3A)

Crushed Gravel No. 1 (4)
	No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
	

	Limestone 2A
	Amerikohl
	$21.85/Ton Del.

	Limestone No. 8 (1B) 

Limestone No. 57 (2B)

Limestone No. 3 (3A)

Limestone No. 1 (4)

Limestone R-3 Rip-Rap
	Amerikohl

Amerikohl

Amerikohl

Amerikohl

Amerikohl
	$28.85/Ton Del.

$22.85/Ton Del.

$22.85/Ton Del.

$22.85/Ton Del.

$24.85/Ton Del.

	Limestone R-4 Rip-Rap
	Amerikohl
	$24.85/Ton Del.

	Limestone R-5 Rip-Rap

Limestone R-6 Rip-Rap
	Amerikohl

Amerikohl
	$31.06/Ton Del.

$31.06/Ton Del.

	Gabion 4" - 8"
	Amerikohl
	$24.85/Ton Del.

	
	
	

	Superpave 9.5 mm
	Northeast
	$63.00/Ton FOB

	Superpave 19 mm
	Northeast
	$55.00/Ton FOB

	Superpave 25 mm
	Northeast
	$53.00/Ton FOB

	Superpave 9.5 mm
	Northeast
	$59.35/Ton FOB

	Superpave 19 mm
	Northeast
	$50.85/Ton FOB

	Superpave 25 mm
	Northeast
	$49.85/Ton FOB


	Line Painting
	
	

	Single Line
	Alpha Space
	$0.05/Ft.

	Double Line

Crosswalk – 6” wide
	Alpha Space

Alpha Space
	$0.108/Ft.

$1.80/Ft.

	Stop Bars
	Alpha Space
	$2.00/Ft.


	Traffic Signs and Posts

Yellow/Green   30” x 30”

Faces 24” x 30”

Faces 30” x 30”  

Faces 30” Stop
	US Municipal   

US Municipal

US Municipal

US Municipal


	$56.25/Each Del.

$10.75/Each Del.

$13.25/Each Del.

$12.50/Each Del.

	1 Color-1 Side   24” x 30”

1 Color-1 Side   30” x 30”
	US Municipal

US Municipal
	$31.45/Each Del.

$37.45/Each Del.

	1 Color-1 Side 30” Stop
	US Municipal
	$34.95/Each Del.

	10’ Base – 2lb./ft.
	Chemung Supply 
	$16.00/Each Del.

	10’ Breakaway Post 
	Chemung Supply 
	$26.50/Each Del.

	12’ Base – 2lb./ft.
	Chemung Supply
	$19.00/Each Del.


	Manhole Adjusting Ring 

26-1/2” Diameter
	SEWER
	

	T = 1-3/4"
	EJ
	$196.00/Each Del.

	T = 2"
	EJ
	$187.00/Each Del.

	T = 2-1/2"
	EJ
	$225.00/Each Del.

	T = 3"
	EJ
	$249.00/Each Del.

	
	
	

	Manhole Adjusting Ring

28-1/2” Diameter

T = 1-3/4”

T = 2”

T = 2-1/2”

T = 3”
Manhole Casting/Cover
	SEWER

EJ

EJ

EJ

EJ
	$184.00/Each Del.

$184.00/Each Del.

$197.00/Each Del.

$237.00/Each Del.

	D = 26-1/2", H = 7
	EJ 
	$475.00/Each Del.

	        Frame Only
	EJ
	$240.00/Each Del.

	        Cover Only
	EJ
	$235.00/Each Del.

	D = 28-1/2”, H = 7
	EJ 
	$245.00/Each Del.

	         Frame Only
	EJ
	$120.00/Each Del.

	         Cover Only
	EJ
	$125.00/Each Del.

	Manhole Lids

D = 26-1/2”, 

D = 28-1/2”,
	(A)

EJ

EJ 
	$225.00/Each Del.

$125.00/Each Del.

	
	
	

	Type "M" Inlet
	
	

	Frame + Grate w/Bicycle Grate- 3”
	EJ
	$390.00/Each Del.

	Bicycle Grate 2’ x 4’ -  3”
	EJ
	$262.00/Each Del.

	Frame-3”

Frame-8”

Frame-10”
	EJ

EJ

EJ
	$123.00/Each Del.

$419.37/Each Del.

$387.00/Each Del.


	Standard Box w/Base 2’ x 4’
	
	

	H = 24”

H = 30”

H = 36”

H = 42”

H = 48”

H = 60”
	Wine

Wine

Wine

Wine

Wine

Wine
	$210.00/Each Del.

$245.00/Each Del.

$250.00/Each Del.

$309.00/Each Del.

$319.00/Each Del.

$410.00/Each Del.

	
	
	

	Conseal
	Wine
	$9.50/Each Del.

	
	
	

	Concrete MH Risers 30”
	
	

	4”
	Wine
	$62.00/Each Del.

	6”
	Wine
	$63.00/Each Del.

	8”
	Wine
	$70.00/Each Del.

	12”
	Wine
	$87.00/Each Del.


	Standard Box w/o Base
	2’ x 4’
	

	H = 24”
	Wine
	$150.00/Each Del.

	H = 30”
	Wine
	$215.00/Each Del.

	H = 36”
	Wine
	$230.00/Each Del.

	H = 42”

H = 48”

H = 60”
	Wine

Wine

Wine


	$290.00/Each Del.

$300.00/Each Del.

$375.00/Each Del.



	Catch Basin Risers 2 x 4
	(B)
	

	4”
	Wine
	$55.00/Each Del.

	6”

8”

12”

18”

24”

30”

36”
	Wine

Wine

Wine

Wine

Wine

Wine

Wine
	$55.00/Each Del.

$75.00/Each Del.

$75.00/Each Del.

$140.00/Each Del.

$148.00/Each Del.

$210.00/Each Del.

$225.00/Each Del.

	42”
	Wine


	$275.00/Each Del.



	Corrugated Polyethylene Pipe 
	Single Wall
	

	4” Pipe (Rolls of 100’)
	Stephenson Equipment
	$0.33/Ft. Del. x 100 = $33.00

	6” Pipe (Rolls of 100’)
	Stephenson Equipment
	$0.84/Ft. Del. x 100 = $84.00

	
	
	

	8” Pipe (20’ Sections)
	Stephenson Equipment
	$1.77/Ft. Del. x 20 = $34.20

	12" Pipe (20’ Sections)
	Stephenson Equipment
	$3.82/Ft. Del. x 20 = $75.60

	15" Pipe (20’ Sections)
	Stephenson Equipment
	$5.23/Ft. Del. x 20 = $101.60

	18" Pipe (20’ Sections)
	Stephenson Equipment
	$7.56/Ft. Del. x 20 = $147.00

	24" Pipe (20’ Sections)

4” Couplers
6” Couplers

8” Couplers
12” Couplers

15” Couplers

18” Couplers

24” Couplers


	Stephenson Equipment

Stephenson Equipment

Stephenson Equipment

Stephenson Equipment

Stephenson Equipment

Stephenson Equipment

Stephenson Equipment

Stephenson Equipment


	$13.46/Ft. Del. x 20 = $261.40

$1.17/Each Del.

$2.00/Each Del.

$3.41/Each Del.

$5.18/Each Del.

$7.28/Each Del.

$10.62/Each Del.

$17.37/Each Del.

	Heavy Duty Corrugated Pipe
	Double Wall
	

	Smooth Interior
	
	

	12” Pipe
	Stephenson Equipment
	$4.17/Ft. Del. x 20 = $83.40

	15” Pipe
	Stephenson Equipment
	$5.50/Ft. Del. x 20 = $110.00

	18” Pipe
	Stephenson Equipment
	$8.07/Ft. Del. x 20 = $161.40

	24” Pipe
	Stephenson Equipment
	$13.23/Ft. Del. x 20 - $264.60

	30” Pipe
	No Bid 
	

	12” Couplers
	Stephenson Equipment
	$5.18/Each Del.

	15” Couplers
	Stephenson Equipment
	$7.28/Each Del.

	18” Couplers
	Stephenson Equipment
	$10.62/Each Del.

	24” Couplers
	Stephenson Equipment
	$17.37/Each Del.

	30” Couplers
	No Bid
	

	4” Wyes 

6” Wyes

4” Tees

6” Tees
	Stephenson Equipment

Stephenson Equipment

Stephenson Equipment

Stephenson Equipment
	$9.02/Each Del.

$15.88/Each Del.

$9.02/Each Del.

$15.88/Each Del.


	SDR 35 PVC Pipe
	Sewer
	

	4”
	Culverts
	$1.65/Ft. Del.

	6”
	Culverts
	$3.05/Ft. Del.

	8”
	Culverts
	$4.55/Ft. Del.

	12”
	Culverts
	$9.95/Ft. Del.

	15”
	Culverts
	$15.10/Ft. Del.

	18”
	Culverts
	$32.45/Ft. Del.

	24”
	Culverts
	$72.45/Ft. Del.


	Corrugated Polyethylene Pipe Heavy Duty w/Bell End
	
	

	4” Pipe
	Stephenson Equipment
	$0.83/Ft. Del. x 20 - $16.60

	6” Pipe

8” Pipe

10” Pipe
	Stephenson Equipment

Stephenson Equipment

Stephenson Equipment
	$1.63/Ft. Del. x 20 = $32.60

$2.44/Ft. Del. x 20 = $48.80

$3.53/Ft. Del. x 20 = $70.60

	12" Pipe
	Stephenson Equipment
	$4.22/Ft. Del. x 20 = $84.40

	15" Pipe
	Stephenson Equipment
	$5.55/Ft. Del. x 20 = $111.00

	18" Pipe
	Stephenson Equipment
	$8.46/Ft. Del. x 20 = $169.20

	24" Pipe
	Stephenson Equipment
	$14.02/Ft. Del. x 20 = $280.40

	30” Pipe
	Stephenson Equipment
	$19.59/Ft. Del. x 20 = $391.80

	36” Pipe
	Stephenson Equipment
	$24.99/Ft. Del. x 20 = $499.80

	48” Pipe
	Stephenson Equipment
	$39.66/Ft. Del. x 20 = $793.20

	60” Pipe
	Stephenson Equipment
	$78.90/Ft. Del. x 20 = $1,578.00

	
	
	

	Wood Carpet Playground

Material

50 c.y.

100 c.y.
	Federouch

Federouch
	$29.49/c.y./Del.

$28.49/c.y./Del.

	
	
	

	Ballfield Mixture

Top Soil
	Federouch

Federouch
	$36.00/Ton Del.

$24.50/Ton/c.y./Del.



Mrs. Hardt noted that that no bids were received for 2B gravel, and it is hoped to award a contract at the next Council meeting.


Following review, it was moved by Mr. Troutman that Borough staff be authorized to enter into contract agreements for commodities the Borough requires with the above vendors who can provide them and will award a contract for 2B gravel at the next meeting if presented.  The motion was duly seconded and passed by unanimous vote.  It is understood that the Borough is not compelled to purchase its requirements of these commodities from these vendors so long as alternative purchases meet legal requirements.  

ENVIRONMENTAL ADVISORY COUNCIL


The following land disturbance application was reviewed by the EAC at its February 11, 2019 meeting:


Application No. 19-01:

Margaretta C. Barton & James P. Kileen





Lot #4, Whispering Pines Lane






New Single-Family Dwelling


It was moved by Mr. Troutman that this application be approved subject to any conditions imposed by the EAC.  The motion was duly seconded and passed by unanimous vote.

PLANNING COMMISSION


Mr. Lauer reported that the Planning Commission met before the Council meeting to review Conditional Use Application 19-02 to install solar panels at 118 South Pasadena Drive.  He stated that the Planning Commission reviewed the Application and found that it met the requirements of the Zoning Ordinance, Section 400.14 (H) (1) thru (9), and recommended approval.  Accordingly, it was moved by Mr. Lauer that Conditional Use Application 19-02 be approved.  The motion was duly seconded and passed by unanimous vote.


Ordinance No. 709

Mr.  Lauer reported that the Planning Commission reviewed the proposed Ordinance that revises the Conditional Use section of the Zoning Ordinance to allow for small wireless facilities (SWF) and recommended approval.  Accordingly, it was moved by Mr. Lauer that Ordinance No. 709 be enacted.  The motion was duly seconded and passed by unanimous vote.    

FINANCIAL


Payment of Bills
It was moved by Mr. Troutman that the payment of bills for March 2019 (General Fund Vouchers 24505-24609, $303,275.69) be ratified for payment.  The motion was duly seconded and passed by unanimous vote.

NEW BUSINESS

ZHB Case No. 19-01

Borough Council indicated that it will not take a position on this Case. 
EXECUTIVE SESSION

At 6:40 PM, Borough Council adjourned into Executive Session to discuss a legal matter.  At 7:15 PM, the meeting was reconvened.

There being no more business to come before Council, the meeting was adjourned at 7:18 PM.

DANA A. ABATE



Borough Secretary 


